
 

July 20, 2020 
 
The East Lampeter Township Board of Supervisors held their regular meeting on Monday, July 
20, 2020 beginning at 7:30 pm at the East Lampeter Township Office: 2250 Old Philadelphia 
Pike, Lancaster, PA 17602. The meeting was called to order by Chairman Corey Meyer. In 
addition to Mr. Meyer, supervisors present were: Mr. Blowers, Mr. Ethan Demme and Mr. 
Glenn Eberly (via zoom). Mr. Dave Buckwalter was absent. Also, present was Mr. Ralph 
Hutchison Township Manager. 
 
The meeting was held using Zoom, an internet web conferencing tool. Chairman Meyer read a 
statement regarding the use of Zoom for this public meeting including instructions for the public 
to use in order to participate in the meeting. 
 
The following persons joined the meeting via Zoom and were present for the meeting: 
 
Rob Lewis, Esq. representing the Devon Creek development 
Lynn Commero, LNP  
Bill Briegel, Keystone Custom Homes 
Chris Venarchick, RGS Associates 
Ken Hornbeck, High Associates 
Larry Miller, Miller & Sons Salt & Water 
 
Public Comment (non agenda items) 
 
None 
 
Consent Agenda 

a. Approval of the Minutes of the Monday, June 15, 2020 Regular Meeting 
b. Approval to pay invoices from all funds: Total - $901,870.83 
c. Financial Security Release – Tru Hotel Land Development – 2310 LHE 
d. Financial Security Release: Stormwater Management Plan – 110 Hartman Br. Rd.  

 
Chairman Meyer presented the bills to be paid from various funds for the total amount of 
$901,870.83. He mentioned the large payment amount of $178,915.49 to Allan Myers, L.P. for 
milling and in place paving materials, $14,000 to Maher Duessel for 2019-year audit services, 
$19,585.17 to Town Planning Partnership for Bridgeport Mobility Plan consulting services, 
$23,089.85 to Alpha Space Control for painted traffic markings and $145,855.62 to Martin 
Paving, Inc. for 2020 road surface treatments (double oil & chip). 
 
Chairman Meyer also mention the Financial Security Release for Tru Hotel; Land Development -
2310 LHE and the Financial Security Release for the Stormwater Management Plan – 110 
Hartman Bridge Road. Applicants have completed all the required public improvements for the 
developments and the Township engineer has provided letters indicating acceptance of the 
construction and recommending release of the financial securities for these projects. 
 



 

Mr. Blowers made a motion to approve the consent agenda as presented. Mr. Demme seconded 
the motion and it was passed by unanimous roll call vote.  
 
 
Old Business 
 

a. Conditional Use Decision re: Devon Creek – New Holland Pike  
 
Ms. Susan Peipher, Township Solicitor was in attendance to give some comments pertaining to 
this item. She stated that after the close of the public hearing process for this application, she 
spoke with Board members individually to hear their thoughts on a decision for this project. 
Based on these individual conversations, she said that she prepared a draft decision for the Board 
to consider. She stated that the decision has thirty-eight (38) findings of fact, it has a discussion 
section, a conclusion and a decision the end result of which is that it approves the request of the 
applicant subject to twenty-seven (27) conditions that were agreed upon between township staff 
and the applicant. Ms. Peipher stated that at this point the decision is up for the Board’s 
consideration. 
 
Mr. Eberly was not able to participate in this decision due to the fact that he had not been able to 
participate in the hearing process for the application. 
 
Mr. Demme expressed a number of concerns regarding the draft decision. He indicated that he 
felt that there were conflicts between certain findings of fact and conditions of approval in the 
decision. He also expressed a desire to have multiple decision options prepared for the Board to 
consider. In addition, Mr. Demme indicated that he felt that the decision draft should have been 
circulated to Board members earlier in order to provide more time for review.  
 
After some discussion between the Board members and Ms. Peipher: 
 
Mr. Blowers made a motion to approve the draft decision as presented to the Board including all 
of the conditions of approval for the alternative plan for the provision of water for all but phase 
one of the Devon Creek development. Mr. Meyer seconded the motion and it was passed by a 
roll call vote of two in favor and one opposed. Mr. Demme voted against the motion. 
 
  

b. Police Department Use of Force Statistics – Chief Zerbe 
 
Chief Zerbe was in attendance to discuss the Police Department Use of Force Statistics. He 
stated that he wanted to give more information as to the statistical value of why the numbers are 
what they are and to further explain what is driving these numbers. Board members thanked 
Chief Zerbe for the information and his leadership of the department. It was agreed that the 
review of these statistics and use of force events would be done on a regular basis with members 
of the Board and the Township Manager. 
 

 
New Business 



 

 
a. High Associates Stormwater Management Plan #20-10: 1740/1770 Hempstead Rd. 

 
Mr. Chris Venarchick RGS Associates and Mr. Ken Hornbeck of High Real Estate Group were 
in attendance to talk to the board about the stormwater management plan for this location. Mr. 
Venarchick stated that this is a stormwater management plan application for 1740 Hempstead 
Road identified as building #380 which is about a 3.7 acre parcel which is located in the BP - 
business park district of the township. The location is along the east side of Hempstead. He also 
said that 1740 Hempstead Road is what is really driving the stormwater management application. 
He further indicated that the reason 1770 Hempstead Rd is part of the rendering is because of 
improvements to be made in order to provide pedestrian connectivity between the two buildings. 
He stated that their goal for the project is that they’re seeking stormwater management approval 
along with the associated modifications of which there are two and upon satisfying the 
outstanding letter from David Miller  & Associates revised on 7/20/20. They are looking at 
essentially an expansion of the parking lot introducing impervious area which will be managed 
by a facility on the property of 1740 Hempstead Road. 
 
Mr. Hornbeck stated that Armstrong Flooring Inc. is going to be the new tenant that is going to 
occupy these two buildings. They are also taking some space in a third existing building. He 
stated that there are two phases to the site work, the stormwater management plan that is in front 
of the board and a submission that they will come back before the board in regards to a building 
that sits to the north with some additional site improvements and some vehicular connectivity 
between the two parcels. 
 
Mr. Blowers made a motion to approve High Associates Stormwater Management Plan #20-10: 
1740/1770 Hempstead Rd based upon David Miller & Associates letter dated 7/16/20 and the  
the revised DMA letter 7/20/20 with the two modifications. Mr. Demme seconded the motion 
and it was passed by unanimous roll call vote.  
 
 
Action Items: 
 

a. Stormwater Management Ordinance Amendment  
 
Mr. Hutchison stated that at the 6-15-20 Board meeting the board asked that the stormwater 
management ordinance be changed so that the threshold for exemption would increase from 500 
square feet to 1,000 square feet. He indicated that the necessary advertising of the ordinance had 
been completed and that the Ordinance is ready for Board action. 
 
Mr. Demme made a motion to adopt the stormwater management ordinance amendment as 
presented. Mr. Blowers second the motion and it was passed by unanimous roll call vote.  
 

Ordinance No. 349 
 
 

b. Resolution re: PADOT Winter Maintenance Agreement – 5 years 



 

 
Mr. Hutchison stated that every five years PADOT has the Board consider an agreement for 
winter maintenance services that the Public Works Department performs on certain state 
highways in the Township where it makes operational sense for the Township forces to provide 
winter maintenance services there. Roads that are involved are Greenfield road where it goes 
over Route 30, Mount Sidney Road, North Ronks and Pitney Road. PennDOT pays the 
Township a flat rate for the lane miles involved.  
 
Mr. Demme made a motion to adopt a Resolution re: PADOT Winter Maintenance Agreement – 
5 years. Mr. Blowers seconded the motion and it was passed by unanimous roll call vote. 
 

Resolution 2020-17 
 
 
Manager’s Report: 
 

a. MS4 Report 
 
Mr. Hutchison stated that the Township is working on the MS4 program and is looking to hire a 
stormwater management coordinator. The Township has received resumes expressing interest. 
Interviews are being schedule. The stormwater fee utility billing has been implemented and has 
gone out with the July quarterly billing with the sanitary sewer charges as well. Township staff is 
working hard to assist property owners with the questions that they have regarding this new fee. 
 

b. Lincoln Highway East Streetscape Plan Implementation Report 
 
Mr. Hutchison stated that the Township continues to meet with its engineer on the Lincoln 
Highway Projects that the Township has underway. The Rockvale Trail project has taken a little 
bit of a pause. Township staff is waiting for the Shoppes at Rockvale plan to come forward now 
that the Board has moved forward with the Zoning amendment for redevelopment of the site. 
Township staff is expecting to see the plan in the coming months. The phase 3 project which is 
the section of highway east of the intersection of Dutch Wonderland and the new Tanger 
intersection is moving forward. The surveyors have been out gathering survey information on the 
highway to facilitate the design. The township is expecting the process to be completed in 
roughly the middle of August. Then the preliminary design will move forward. The Western 
Gateway project which the Township is not directly involved in but is included in the process, is 
also moving forward. It’s a PennDOT project being designed through the County’s cooperative 
agreement that they have with PennDOT. They’re in the process of getting certain approvals 
from PennDOT so they can move into preliminary design and it looks like it will be completed 
on time. The Township will need to work with PennDOT on allocating the construction dollars 
needed once the design and permitting process is completed. At the present time, the only dollars 
that are allocated for the project are for the preconstruction activities related to the project. The 
other project in the corridor is the trail between Strasburg Pike and Oakview Road. The 
Township was allocated funding through the County’s Smart Growth Transportation program. 
The agreement is not yet in place but Township staff was told that it will come early in 2021. 
 



 

c. Walnut Street Extension / Great Lancaster Heritage Pathway Report 
 
Mr. Hutchison stated that High Associates staff are working very hard to complete the design for 
the Walnut Street Extension. They are designing the Greater Lancaster Heritage pathway at the 
same time as part of the process and seeking approvals to use the right-of-way from PennDOT 
for both the road extension and the pathway. There are some issues that have to be resolved as 
part of the process, including who is going to own the pathway and who is going to maintain it 
etc. Township staff is working to find construction dollars for the pathway. 
 

d. Pandemic Response 
 
Mr. Hutchison stated that Township staff is working everyday in the office and that there’s a 
system set up for people that come to the building to screen them and take care of their needs in 
the vestibule area without having to come into the building. Staff is following the orders that  
come from Harrisburg on social distancing and wearing masks. Park facilities are open. The 
Township continues to monitor the current year budget due to the economic impact of the 
COVID–19 virus. Township staff expects to begin looking at the preparation of the 2021 budget. 
Township is waiting for the County to provide information on their federal CARES dollars that 
the Township can apply for in order to have certain COVID – 19 related expenses reimbursed. 
 
 
Adjournment 
 
A motion was made by Mr. Demme seconded by Mr. Blowers to adjourn the meeting. The 
motion was passed by unanimous voice vote. The next regularly scheduled meeting is to be 
held on Monday, August 3, 2020 beginning at 7:30 pm. 
 
 
Respectfully submitted, 
Ralph Hutchison 
Township Manager 
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